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Lesvos Petrified Forest Geopark is a good example of using Geoparks as natural 
laboratories on Planet Earth processes to educate the public in order to reduce the 
consequences of natural disasters.
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Chapada Diamantina consists in a group of mountains and karst reliefs, sculpt-
ed in siliciclastic and carbonate rocks from the Proterozoic Eon, which extends for 
around 65.000 km2 located in the center of the Bahia State in northeast Brazil. 
During the 19th century the extraction of gold and diamonds was the main econom-
ic activity. With the exhaustion of the reserves in the early 20th century, its econo-
my declined. Tourism uplifted the economy of some cities of this region during the 
80s decade of the 20th century. This activity is mainly based in the geological herit-
age represented by the landscapes, waterfalls and caves.

An inventory of the geological heritage was made, followed by the development 
of a specific methodology for the assessment of 40 geosites. This procedure is the 
support for the proposal of creation of three geoparks in this region, which will help 
the conservation and promotion of the Chapada Diamantina’s geological heritage. 
These actions will also increase and add value to the tourism that is on course now-
adays, helping to expand the opportunities for other cities of this region.

The assessment methodology is based in 20 parameters, divided by 4 groups of 
values, as follows: intrinsic, scientific, touristic and use/management value. This 
group of values was later used to establish an order for the scientific, touristic and 
conservation use, so as to rank the relevance of the inventoried geosites. Eight ge-
osites were considered with international relevance and nine with national rele-
vance. Comparing the field considerations for the level of protection and the results 
obtained for the conservation value, some proposals for geosites conservation and 
promotion were prepared.

The creation of geoparks in Chapada Diamantina will raise geotourism in that 
region and contribute for the consolidation of the sustainable development. It will 
also be helpful tasks for the territorial planning and management, bringing and ex-
panding new opportunities for the population of many municipalities that nowa-
days doń t face tourism and conservation as profitable and necessary activities. 
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Important elements of tourist supply Gjirokastra district are protected areas (na-
tional and regional parks). After 1993, with the emergence of environmental law, in 
Gjirokastra district was created Protected Areas system, according to the criteria of 
the International Union on conservation of Nature (IUCN). Natural Parks District 
exercises the main functions of the protected area, as areas where traditional activ-
ities can be performed and as a space for recreation and entertainment. Rural space 
tourist district has precious assets, such as the local market, regional and national, 
as well as the international. This property presents special interest due to position-
ing the county in a region with tourist tradition and the important movement cor-
ridors tourist. Movements across space tourist place and are perennial, so restful (in 
the form of picnics and excursions), health, cultural, political, social, educational, 
economic, etc. Prior to 1990, foreign tourists came from Sweden, the Netherlands, 
Italy, France, Turkey, Greece etc. Opening Kaka vies customs point in 1984 brought 
the addition of foreign tourists (mostly Greek) and revival of tourism. In the early 
1990s there was a genuine tourist development, due to lack of political stability, or-
der and safety, damage to infrastructure and tourism values, etc. Later political fac-
tors and socio-economic reassessment affected the tourism sector, development of 
family tourism and transit (hours or several days), increasing number and expanded 
the geography of tourists, opening new jobs and increase incomes. To date the re-
gion’s tourism assets are not used effectively. Rural communities are not yet aware 
of the importance of development of this sector. However, natural parks and rural 
tourism offers the opportunity to attract tourist groups to show interest in the na-
ture of the county, rural life, customs, culture, lifestyle and nutrition. This rein-
forces the fact that the original values that carries natural, eco-tourism in Gjirokas-
tra district is unique.
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